Notice for Website

Sickle Cell Institute Chhattisgarh

(An Autonomous institute of govt. of Chhattisgarh)

28™ July 2015

Declaration of Price Bid of

RATE CONTRACT TENDER FOR SUPPLY OF MEDICINES & VACCINES, CHEMICALS/ KITS/
CONSUMABLE,/ DISPOSABLE AND ACCESSORIES.

Tender Ref. No.: SCIC/Tenders/2014/001, Date: 10t Oct, 2014

On the basis of successive evaluations of prequalification and technical documents, the price bid
for the referred tender has been declared as per the enclosed list. Item wise respective L1 can be
seen on the list herein. As per the tender clause, in section- Il (6), the purchaser has the right to
award a contract for the L1 firm for respective firm. It will be notified further through
appropriate mean. L1 Price match could also be called for matching the prices for few items.

In case of any clarification/doubt on the list and price bid, please feel free to write to the
undersigned within 10 days of publishing this notice.

Sd-

Director General, SCIC, Raipur

Office of the Director General, sickle Cell Institute Chhattisgarh, 3" floor, Dep’t. Of Biochemistry, Pt. J.N.M. Medical College
Raipur, Chhattisgarh, Pin-492001, Phone/Fax: 0771-2885505, Email stores@scic.co.in Website: www.scic.co.in




Sickle Cell Institute Chhattisgarh

Tender Ref. No.: SCIC/Tenders/2014/001, Date: 10" Oct, 2014

Declaration of the price bid.

Kits
Sr | Ref. Name of the Item Unit L1 Remark
No. | No.
Unit Make Price Firm
1 1 Beta- thal shqrt NQ No Bid
programme Kits
Sickle cell short
2 2. programme (Neonatal NQ No Bid
screening)
3 3. Paper roll for variant 11 NQ No Bid
4 n M-30R Rinse Solution 20 Itr Agappe 3562 Scientific Single Bid
traders
M-30 D Diluent Scientific . .
5 5. Solution 20 Itr Agappe 3809 iraders Single Bid
M-30 CFL Lyse Scientific . .
6 6. Solution 500ml Agappe 3562 traders Single Bid
7 7. MR A 4x50 ml | Agappe 1286 scientific Single Bid
traders
8 8. M-30P Probe Cleanser axs0ml | Agappe 1195 Scientific Single Bid
traders
9 9. Haematology Control 6x3 ml Agappe 11025 Scientific Single Bid
traders
PCR Mix Kit (2x) Invitrogen 7900 Surana _ _
101 10, or 2600 Enterprises Single Bid
SRL P
Chemicals
S . .
Nr Ref Name of the Item Unit L1 Remark
0. ] No.
Unit Make Price Firm Remark
1. Cellulose Acetate | 25x160m 100 Abdos 4900 Ideal
11 . . ‘
strips (100/oKD) strips Chemicals
2. Saponin 25 gm. 100 gm | Himedia 3520 | Syma medical
12 and dental
3. 13 Saponin White AR. | 500 gm 500 gm 4910 Kasliwal
Brothers
4. Di Potassium 500 gm 500gm | S.D.Fine 302
14 | Hydrogen Phosphate Pharmadeal
5. i dPotasngr:n D|h t 500 gm 500gm | S.D.Fine 268 Pharmadeal |yyoo e price
rogen Phosphate ;
15 ydrog P and Kasliwal match for
brothers L1
6. Sodium Di thionate | 500 gm GRM75 | Himedia 335
Ideal
16 01-500G .
Chemicals
7. Tris Powder 500 gm GRM12 | Himedia 1658 deal
17 18-500G .
Chemicals
8. EDTA Disodium salt| 500 gm 500gm | S.D.Fine 462
18 g g Pharmadeal
9. 19 Boric acid 500 gm 500gm | S.D.Fine 226 Pharmadeal




10. | ,, | Panceaue S sodium | 500 gm RMO77- | Himedia | 849 Ideal
salt 25G Chemicals
11. Trichloro acetic acid | 500 gm 500gm | S.D.Fine 346
21 g J Pharmadeal
12. PHA -M 10 mg 10mg Himedia 2310 [ Syma medical
22 | (Phytohemagglutinin and dental
) surgical
13. | 23 Petroleum ether 1L 1L S.D.Fine 599 Pharmadeal
14, hloroform 1L S.D.Fine 333
24 Chiorofo 1 Pharmadeal
15. | 25 | Hydrogen peroxide 1L 1L. Merck 259 Kasliwal | o, ngle Bid
16. 26 Acetonitrile 10L 2.5 Litre| S.D.Fine 1135 Pharmadeal
17. 27 Methanol 10L 2.5 Litre| S.D.Fine 465 Pharmadeal
18. 28 Acetone 1L 1L S.D.Fine 388 Pharmadeal
19. 29 Carbon tetrachloride 1L 1L. Merck 2350 Kasliwal
Brothers Single Bid
20. | 30 Tetrahydrofuran 1L 1L S.D.Fine 1009 Pharmadeal
21. 31 Diethyl ether 5L 2.5 Litre| S.D.Fine 935 Pharmadeal
22. | 39 Formaldehyde 2L 5 lit Merck 940.00 Kasliwal
500 ml 210.00 Brothers
23. | 33 Phosphoric acid 1L 500ml | S.D.Fine 369 Pharmadeal
24. 1 54 Glutaraldehyde 2L 500 ml Merck 440 Kasliwal
Brothers
25. Gentisic acid (2,5 50 gm 149357- |  Sigma 4320
35 | dihydroxybenzoic 100G Ch'def"l |
acid) emicals
26. 36 3 hydroxy piconilic | 10 pgm
acid NQ
27. 4 hydroxy 3 methoxy| 50 pgm
37 cinnaminic acid
NQ
28. | 38 Piconilic acid 50 pugm NQ
29. | 39 Sinapinic acid 50 pgm D7927- | Sigma 2487 Ideal
1G Chemicals
30. 10 a-cyano 4 hydroxy 10 pgm 10x10 Sigma 21255 Kasliwal
cinnaminic acid mg Brothers Single Bid
3L Peptide MW markers| 100 pgm MWSDS| Sigma 24403
Ideal
41 17S-1VL .
Chemicals
2| 4 Horse heart 100 pgm 250mg | Sigma | 6930 Kasliwal
myoglobin Brothers Single Bid
38| 43 Glucagon 500 pgm 5mg Sigma 22134 Kasliwal
Brothers
34. Glufibrinopeptide 10 pgm 1m Sigma 28225 Kasliwal . .
44 PP Ho ’ ’ Rrothers Single Bid
35. Leucine encephalin | 10 pgm 10 mg Sigma 5395 Kasliwal . _
45 Brathers Single Bid
36. 46 Immersion oil 500ml 125 ml Merck 970 Kasliwal
Brothers
37. 47 Trypsin (1:250) 10 pgm 25¢g 2475 Surana
1009 18685 Enterprises
38. 48 Colcemid 25 mg 10 mg Sigma 22225 Kasliwal _ _
Brothers [ Single Bid




39. Giemsa stain lequid 100 100ML | Himedia 225 | Syma medical
49 mi and dental
surgical
40. Giemsa stain Powder 100 25GM | Himedia 315 Syma medical
50 gm and dental
surgical
41. | 51 Xylene 2.0 Its 1 Litre | S.D.Fine 332 Pharmadeal
42. | g L-glutamine 50 pgm 25¢ 270.00 Surana
100g 5575 Enterprises
43. 53 Penicillin 100 pgm 100 ugm| Sigma 10695 Kasliwal
Brothers
4. gy Streptomycin 100 pgm S6501- Sigma 2611 Ideal
25G Chemicals
o 55 Gentamycin 100 pgm 1g 630 900 Surana
10ml Enterprises
46. | 56 Ficoll Hypaque 51t NQ
47. | 57 Heparin 100 gm NQ
48. 58 Pyrogallol 1.0 Its 100 g 1575 Surana
Enterprises
49. 59 Octadecylsilane 100 g
powder (ODS) NQ
0. 1 60 Xanthine 59 59 321 Surana
Enterprises
L1 61 Thiobarbituric acid 259 RM1594{ Himedia 1066 Ideal
25G Chemicals
52. 2 deoxy ribose 100 pgm 5GM | Himedia 1704 | Syma medical
62 and dental
surgical
53. 63 Hypoxanthine 100 pgm 19 114 Surana
Enterprises
54. | g4 | Xanthine oxidase 25 mg NQ
55. | g5 | Tertbutyl alcohol 51t 2.5 litre 1260 Surana
Entaornricac
6. | &6 Nonanoic acid 10 mg N5502- [ Sigma 3343 Ideal . _
25G Chemicals | Single Bid
57. BSTFA (bis 50 mg RM1651{ Himedia 1743
67 | (trimethyl silyl) 25GM Ideal
. . Chemicals
trifluoroacetamide)
58. Trimethyl chlorsilane| 100 gm
68
NQ
59. NADPH 100 gm 100GM | Himedia 2644 | Syma medical
69 and dental
surgical
60. 70 TNF (alpha) 100 gm H8916- | Sigma 11985 Ideal
10UG Chemicals
61 | 71 Agarose 500 gm 500 gm 12458 pharmadeal
62. Acrylamide 100 gm 500gm | Himedia 380 [ Syma medical
72 and dental
surgical
63. | 73 Bisacrylamide 500 gm 500 g 2160 Surana
Enterprises
64. | 74 Dithiiothreitol 250 gm RM525- | Himedia 5943 Ideal
25G Chemicals
65. | -5 Dithioerythrytol 250 gm GRM35 | Himedia 2640 Ideal . _
9-1G Chemicals__| Single Bid
66. | 76 lodoacetic acid 25 gm RM562- [ Himedia 5240 Ideal
25G Chemicals
67. 1 77 lodoacetamide 25 gm RM9637| Himedia | 10660 Ideal
Chemicals
68. Trypsin (TPCK 25gm 4370285-| Sigma 7912 Ideal
78 . . .
treated) IKT Chemicals | Single Bid




69. | ;9 | Sodium carbonate 250 gm GRM25 | Himedia 154 Ideal
4-500G Chemicals
70. 80 Fetal bovine serum 2 Itr 1 litre 55283 Surana
Enterprises
71. Glycine 500 gm GRM13 | Himedia 503 Ideal
81 44-500G -
Chemicals
2.1 g Tricine 500 gm RM842- | Himedia 1984 Ideal
100G Chemicals
3. | g3 Bicine 500 gm 500 g 5950 Surana
Enterprises
74. | g4 | Barium hydroxide 500 gm GRM27 | Himedia 168 Ideal
9-500G Chemicals
75. 85 CHAPS 25 gm 109 7135 Surana
Enterprises
76. 86 ASB-14 25gm Al1346- Sigma 7528 Ideal
1G Chemicals
7. Thiourea 250 mg 500 GM | Himedia 380 | Syma medical
87 and dental
surgical
78. | 88 Cisplastin 500 gm NQ
79. 89 Urea 1 kg GRM63 | Himedia 137 Ideal
2-500G Chemicals
80. 90 Hydroxyapatite 250 gm RM8471{ Himedia | 16564 Ideal
10G Chemicals
8L | o1 PMSF 25 gm 109 4035 Surana
Enterprises
82. 92 Hepes buffer 1000 ml MBO016- | Himedia 1804 Ideal
100G Chemicals
83. 93 Formaldehyde 5 Itr AS017- | Himedia 744 Ideal
5L Chemicals
84. Vasoactive intestinal 50 mg V6130- Sigma 31911 Ideal
94 . )
peptide SMG Chemicals
85. 95 Peptide N 100 mg
glycosidase F NQ
86. | 96 Glycosidases 250 mg NQ
87. 2,5 dihydrobenzoic 2 Itr 5GM | Himedia 4265 | Syma medical
97 acid and dental
surgical Single Bid
88. - 2,4,6 trihydroxy 250 gm T64602- | Sigma 16574 Ideal
acetophenone 25G Chemicals
89. | 99 | Ammonium citrate 500 gm GRM12 | Himedia 572 Ideal
90. 100 Ethylene glycol 5 Itr 2.5 Litre 980 pharmadeal
91. | 101 | Sodium periodate 250 gm 500 gm 3724 pharmadeal
92. 1 102 Stearic acid 100 mg 5¢9 360 Surana
Enterprises
93. Palmitic acid 100 mg 500 GM | Himedia 242 | Syma medical
103 and dental
surgical
94. | 104 | Arachidonic acid 100 mg 250 mg Sigma 13035 Kasliwal
9. | 105 Linoleic acid 100 mg RM566- | Himedia 1294 Ideal
1G Chemicals
%. | 106 Linolenic acid 100 mg L2376- [ Sigma 5742 Ideal _ _
500MG Chemicals | Single Bid
9.1 107 Apotransferrin 50 mg T1428- | Sigma 5539 Ideal
50MG Chemicals
9. | 108 Caeruloplasmin 100 mg 100 U Sigma 66360 Kasliwal
Brothers
99. 109 CDNB (1 chloro 2,4 25gm 1g 3330 Surana

dinitrobenzene)

Enterprises




100. 1 gamma glutamylp | 25gm 100 g 4500 Surana
110 . - _
nitroanilide Enterprises
101 | 414 Glycyl glycine 100 mg 100 g 4500 Surana
Enterprises
Brothers
103. p-phenylenediamine | 50 mg GRM73| Himedia 2432 Ideal
113 70-250G -
Chemicals
104. Ferrozine 50 mg RM1406{ Himedia 653 Ideal
114 .
1G Chemicals
105. | 445 DCFH-DA 100 gm 100 mi 7740 Surana . _
Enterprises | Single Bid
106. Diethyl 250 gm 159220- | Sigma 9932 Ideal
116 . . .
pyrocarbonate 100G Chemicals | Single Bid
107. 117 8-OH guanosine 50 mg S5gm 12900 };?:1:1\,:?: Single Bid
108. 1 118 Nuclease P1 100 mg N8630- | Sigma 30705 Ideal . _
1VL Chemicals | Single Bid
109. | 419 | Acid phosphatase 250 mg P1146- | Sigma 4323 Ideal _ _
50UN Chemicals | Single Bid
110. Freund complete 500 mg
120 .
adjuvants NQ
111. 121 Freund incomplete 500 mg
adjuvants NQ
112. 122 Sepharose 4B 500 mg 4B200- Sigma 12774 Ideal
100ML Chemicals
113. | 103 4-vinylpyridine 500 mg V3204- | Sigma 6987 Ideal _ _
5ML Chemicals | Single Bid
114. DEPC 100 mi 100 ml 1728 Surana
124 :
Enterprises
115. p-hydroxyphenyl 50 ml
125
glyoxal NQ
116. EDC (1 ethyl 3 59 270
dimethyl amino Surana
126 o :
propyl) carbodiimide Enterprises
117. MES (2 250 ml RM1128{ Himedia 2335
127 | morpholinoethanesul 100G |deal
. . Chemicals
fonic acid)
118. 128 Glycine ethyl ester 250 ml 100 g 416 Surana
Enterprises
119. 129 Methyl acetimidate 500 ml 25gm sigma 3981 Kasliwal
hydrochloride Brothers
120. | 44 Dioxane 500 gm AS049- | Himedia 424 Ideal
500ML Chemicals
121. Aluminium 250 gm GRMS55 | Himedia 302 Ideal
131 hydroxide 98-500G Chemicals
122. 132 Sodium hypochlorite 2 1tr 1lit 275 Kasliwal
Brothers Single Bid
123. NTCB (2 nitro 5 250 gm 250 gm 7195 Kasliwal
133 thiocyanobenzoate) Brothers
124. 134 Hydroxylamine 500 gm GRM38| Himedia 754 Idegl
2-500G Chemicals
125. 135 Amino acid standards| 100 mg A6282- | Sigma 1900 Ideal
1ML Chemicals | Single Bid
126. Marfey reagent (1 25 gm RM2207{ Himedia 2460
136 25G Ideal
fluoro 2, 4 Chemicals

dinitrobenzene)




127. 1 437 Triethylamine 1ltr AS076- | Himedia 278 Ideal
500ML Chemicals
128. | 138 Cytochrome ¢ 250 mg 500 mg 2250 Surana
Enterprises
129. 139 Super oxide 25 gm 20 KU 8160 Surana
dismutase Enterprises | Single Bid
130. Phorbol myristate 250 gm 25gm sigma 84260 Kasliwal
140
acetate Brothers
131. Opsonized zymosan 25gm
141
NQ
132. Glutathione 250 mg 2250 Surana
142 .
reductase Enterprises
133. 143 Saphedex G-100 250 gm GE17- Sigma 38098 Ideal
0060-01 Chemicals
134. | 144 Saphedex G-50 250 gm GE17- | Sigma 26237 Ideal
0044-01 Chemicals
135. | 145 | Saphedex G-25 250 gm G25300- Sigma | 41126 I deal
100G Chemicals
136. Isoamyl nitrite 25 gm RM8516{ Himedia 2804 Ideal
146 100ML .
Chemicals
147 | triamine penta acetic and dental
acid) surgical
138. 148 Nitroglutathione (RS{ 25gm
NO) NQ
139. 149 Nitrosocysteine (Cys{ 200 gm 250gm | sigma 4600 Kasliwal
NO) Brothers
140. Mercuric chloride 250 gm GRM10 | Himedia 4275 deal
150 67-250G .
Chemicals
141. Naphthylethylenedia| 25 gm 25gm | Himedia 4532 | Syma medical
151 mine and dental
surgical
142. 1 g5 Alcian blue 25gm RM471-| Himedia 8118 Ideal
25G Chemicals
143. 153 Fluorescein 25gm GRM94 | Himedia 104 Ideal
3-25G Chemicals
144, 154 Cascade blue 25 gm NO
145, 155 Tetramethyl 25gm
rhodamine NQ
146. 156 Bopidy 576/589 25 gm NO
147. 157 Texas red 25 gm NO
148. | 1cg Cy-5 250 mg GEPA25[ Sigma | 25698 deal
000 Chemicals
149. 159 RPMI 1640 250 gm 10 litre 1340 Surana
Enterprises
150. 4 hydroxy 2 nonenal | 250 gm
160
NQ
151. 161 Coomassie brilliant 25 gm 25¢ 2070 Surana
blue R-250 Enterprises
152. 162 Coomassie brilliant 25 gm 25¢ 2250 Surana
blue G-250 Enterprises
153. Hanks balanced salt 2 Itr 1 litre 2149 Surana
163 . :
solution Enterprises




154, Sodium tartarate 500 gm GRM75| Himedia 657 Ideal
164 20-500G .
Chemicals
155. Triton X-114 1ltr x114-1L Sigma 5535 Ideal
165 )
Chemicals
156. | 166 DMSO 1kg AS121- | Himedia 355 Ideal
500ML Chemicals
157. 167 Sodium 250 gm
bicinchoninate NQ
158. MOPS buffer 1 Itr 1ltr Sigma 19180 Kasliwal
168
Brothers
159. Ethanol (05 Itr x 10) 500 ml | Imported 240 Kasliwal
169
Brothers
160. 170 Hydroxyphenyl 2 Itr RM3497{ Himedia 845 Ideal
acetic acid 25G Chemicals
161. AminoMAX culture 5 Itr 450 ml 5550 Surana
171 . .
medium Enterprises
162. Ham”s F12 medium 2 Itr 51445C-| Sigma 3605 deal
172 1000ML .
Chemicals
163. Hemoglobin removal
173 kit NQ
164. Albumin removal kit
174 NQ
165. | 475 | Sypro ruby stain S4942- | Sigma 8536 Ideal
200ML Chemicals
166. Cytokine 100 tests 100 test 130300
UltraSensitive
176 Human 10-Plex . Sturan_a
Panel Cat.No. NIETPrISes
LHC6004)
167. MCP-1 (MCAF) 100 tests 100 UG 59000
177 Recombinant Human Surana
Cat.No. PHC1013 Enterprises
168. Inflammatory 100 tests 100 test 68000
178 Cytokine Mouse 4- Surana
Plex Panel Cat.No Enterprises
LMC 0003
169. Sanitizers 500 ml Himedia 2019 | Syma medical
179 and dental
surgical
170. Hand wash (liquid 500 ml Molyche| Himedia 110 Ideal
180 .
soap) m Chemicals
171. Spirit 1 litre Mukund & [85 650 Ideal
181 )
Surgex Chemicals
172. Sodium Hypochlorite[ 5 litre 5 litre 326
182 (4%) pharmadeal
173 183 Phenyl 5Lir. 5 litre 250 pharmadeal
174. 184 Room Freshener 500 ml
Spray NQ
175. Paper rolls
185 P NQ
Glasswares and consumables
Qr Raf L1




[N}

Name of the Item Unit Specific . . )
No. [ No. gtion Unit | Make | Price Firm Remark
1. | 186 KT Tube (12 x 75 mm) 1 Borosil 4.83 Kasliwal
(Glass) Brothers | Single Bid
2. | 187 KT Tube (12 x 75 mm) 1 Tarson 0.78 Kasliwal
(Plastic) Brothers | Single Bid
3. | 188 Beaker (100 ml) 1 Borosil 47.9 Kasliwal
Brothers | Single Bid
4, | 189 Beaker (250 ml) 1 Borosil 50.5 Kasliwal
Brothers | Single Bid
5. | 190 Beaker (500 ml) 1 Borosil 82.7 Kasliwal
Brothers | Single Bid
6. | 191 Beaker (1000 ml) Borosil 1715 Kasliwal
Brothers | Single Bid
7. | 192 Beaker (2000 ml) Borosil 339 Kasliwal
Brothers | Single Bid
8. | 193 Test Tube Stand (12/20/40 | 12hole | 10Pc Axiva 1014 Scientific
holes) Traders
20 hole 1no. Tarson 201.00 Kasliwal
40 Hole 1no 218.00 Brothers
9. 194 Pipette Bulbs ( for 2ml, 5ml, 1 no. 10.50 )
10ml) ino. 1 13.00 Kasliwal
no. 14.00 Brothers
10. | 195 Microtips (100 1000/pkt| Tarsons 227 Scientific
ph(Yellow) ) Trade_rg
11. | 196 Microtips (1000 1000/pkt| Tarsons 255 Scientific
ul)(Blue) . Traders
12. 197 Autopipette (200-1000 pl|10-1000 ul 1 Eppendrof | 13896
vol.) (Marketed
By Ideal
S.D.Fine) Chemicals
13. | 198 Autopipette (10-200 ul | 20-200 ul 1 Eppendrof | 13896
vol.) (Marketed
By Ideal
S.D.Fine) Chemicals
14. | 199 Autopipette Stand 1 pc. Axiva 1235 Scientific
Traders
15. | 200 Conical flasks (100ml) 1 ASGI 49 Ideal
Chemicals
16. | 201 Conical flasks (250ml) 1 ASGI 75 Ideal
Chemicals
17. | 202 Conical flasks (500ml) 1 ASGI 114 Ideal
Chemicals
18. | 203 | Measuring Cylinder (25ml) 1 ASGI 81 Ideal
Chemicals
19. | 204 | Measuring Cylinder (50ml) 1 ASGI 88 Ideal
Chemicals
20. | 205 | Measuring Cylinder (100ml) 1 ASGI 111 Ideal
Chemicals
21. | 206 | Measuring Cylinder (250ml) 1 ASGI 211 Ideal
Chemicals
22. | 207 | Measuring Cylinder (500ml) 1 ASGI 332 Ideal
Chemicals
23. | 208 | Measuring Cylinder | (1000ml) 1 ASGI 523 Ideal
Chemicals
24, | 209 Volumetric flask (100ml) 1 ASGI 70 Ideal
Chemicals
25. | 210 Volumetric flask (250ml) 1 ASGI 98 Ideal
Chemicals
26. | 211 Volumetric flask (500ml) 1 ASGI 174 Ideal

Chemicals




27. | 212 Volumetric flask (1000ml) 1 ASGI 237 Ideal
Chemicals
28. | 213 |Cellulose Acetate strips [25x160mm(1 100 Sartorius 6290 Kasliwal
00/pkt) Brothers
29. | 214 Evacuated tubes 10000 pcs
(Lithium heparin) NQ
30. | 215 Glass Borosil 220.00
Bottles(100,150,200,25 230.00
0,500 ml) NQ
225.00 Kasliwal
500.00 Brothers Single Bid
31. | 216 Membrane filter 100 nos | Himedia 943 Ideal
(47mm) Chemicals
32. | 217 Pasteur pipettes 500/pkt. | Axiva 1800 Scientific
(018435) Traders
33. | 218 Rubber bands 1 pkt Local 150 Ideal
Chemicals | Single Bid
34. | 219 Stickers NQ
35. | 220 Caps 100 nos | Amkey 250 Ideal
Chemicals | Single Bid
36. | 221 Spatula 50 nos | himedia 1780
Syma medical
dental surgical
37. | 222 Glass Slides 50 Blue Star 36.12
Slides/pk Scientific
t. Traders
38. | 223 | Culture flasks (50ml) 20x10 | Himedia 7770 Ideal
Chemicals | Single Bid
39. 224 | Microtips (with filter)- 2-20 ul Tarson 1.68
2-20pl, 5-50 pl,100- 5-50 pl 1.68
1000 pl 100-1000 2.14 Kasliwal
ul Brothers
40. | 225 Membrane filter Tarson 3220 Kasliwal
assembly Brothers
41. | 226 Centrifuge tubes 500 Nos.| Tarson 2950 Kasliwal
(Falcon tubes)-15ml Brothers
42. | 227 | Filter paper Whatman 5x100/pk|Axiva(1001| 2543.00
No. 1 t. 10R) 2742.00
5x100/pk|Axiva(1001| 30410.00
t 25R) o
5x100/pk| Axiva(1004 Scientific
t. 65R) Traders
43. | 228 Coplin jar 12 pcs axiva 217 Scientific
Traders
44. | 229 | Eppendorfs (1.5ml) 500 pcs | axiva 284 Scientific
Traders
45. | 230 Spacer for 1.5 mm,
electrophoresis plates | 1mm, 0.5
mm NQ
46. | 231 Centrifugal filters MWCO-
3000 NQ
47. | 232 Centrifugal filters MWCO-
10000 NQ
48. | 233 Centrifugal filters MWCO-
30000 NQ
49. | 234 Albumin & IgG Hi Trap
depletion columns Albumin &
IgG
depletion NQ
50. | 235 Spacer for 1.5 mm,
electrophoresis plates | 1mm, 0.5
mm NQ




51. | 236 Nitrocellulose 1.3cm | 100/pkt. [Axiva(1600| 752.00
membrane 205 cm | 100/pkt. 13R) 840.00
4.7cm | 100/pkt. | Axiva(1600( 1327.00
25R)
Axiva(1600 Scientific
A7R) Traders
52. | 237 IPG strips 11cm 12 Strips|Genaxy(Ser| 15013
va, Scientific
Germany) Traders
53. | 238 IPG strips 17 cm 12 Strips|Genaxy(Ser| 16680
va, Scientific
Germany) Traders
54, 239 Syringe filter 0.45nm |13mm 25| 500 pc | Whatman | 23075.0 Kasliwal
mm 26730.0 Brothers
55. | 240 Syringe filter 0.2 nm 13mm 25| 500 pc | Whatman | 23075.0 Kasliwal
mm 26730.0 Brothers
56. | 241 Nitrocellulose 0.45 pm 1.3 2.5 |100/pkt. |Axiva(1600| 752.00
membrane 4.7 100/pkt. 13R) 840.00
100/pkt. | Axiva(1600| 1327.00
25R)
Axiva(1600 Scientific
47R) Traders
57. | 242 | TLC plates (cellulose)
NQ
58. | 243 | C-18 SPE cartridges NQ
59. | 244 | Neubauer counting German 950 Ideal
chamber Chemicals
60. | 245 Kimwips 11.17x21.3| 280 nos | Tarson 196.00
cm 240nos 633.00
37.33x42.1 Kasliwal
6 cm Brothers
61. | 246 Forceps 140 Kasliwal
Brothers
62. 247 Glass slide cleaning
detergent NQ
63. | 248 Glass tray 1 ASGI 406 Ideal
Chemicals | Single Bid
64. | 249 Slide marker Tarson 290 Kasliwal
Brothers | Single Bid
65. | 250 Lithium heparin 100/pk
vacutainer NQ
66- | 251- Deleted due to repeatation of items
70 | 255
71. 256 Thermometer Tarson 160
72. | 257 | Falcon Centrifuge tube | Single flow 500 nos. | ABDOS 3121
(15ml) with screw pack
cap,conical bottom Suran.a
Enterprises
73. | 258 | Falcon Centrifuge tube | Single flow [sterile non; Tarson 8.03
(50ml) with screw cap, pack steriler 7.69
conical bottom
100ml with screw cap,
conical bottom
74. 259 Rack for centrifuge 10/pk Tarson 183
tubes for 50ml &15 ml
centrifuge tubes
75. | 260 Four way rack for 5/pk 5 Nos Abdos 1187

centrifuge tube for 15
&50 ml Centrifuge
tubes

Ideal
Chemicals




76. | 261 Racks for 5/pk 6 nos. ABDOS 1424
microcentrifuge tubes
open ( 100 places |deal
folding) Chemicals
77. | 262 Microtips (100 1000/pk 1000/pkt|  Axiva 305 Scientific
ul)(Yellow) , Traders
78. | 263 Microtips (0.5 -10 500/pk 1000/pkt| Axiva 464 Scientific
ul)(white) , Traders
79. | 264 Microtips (1000 1000/pk 1000/pkt|  Axiva 366 Scientific
ul)(Blue) , Traders
80. | 265 | Volex Empty box for 2/pk 2 pcs. Axiva 205 Scientific
microtips (1 -200 pl) Traders
81. 266 | Volex Empty box for 2/pk 2 pcs. Axiva 269
microtips ( 200 -1000 Scientific
ul) Traders
82. 267 | Microtips individually 100/ pk 100/pkt. Axiva 267
packed,sterile,universal
(1-200 pl) Scientific
Traders
83. | 268 | Microtips individually 100/ pk 100/pkt. |  Axiva 270
packed,sterile,universal
(1-200 pI) Scientific
Traders
84. | 269 Cotton 500 gm 1 Hampton | 114 Ideal
Chemicals
85- | 270- Deleted due to repeatation of items
86. | 271
87. 272 Latex Gloves 25pairs/pk
disposable powder Not found
free suitable
88. | 273 Pasteur 100 /pk each| 1 ml 3 ml | 500 pcs. Axiva 1525.00
Pipette(Disposable) 500pcs. Axiva 1534.00
individually packed
sterile 1ml and 3ml Scientific
araduated Traders
89. | 274 | Micropipette - 0.1-2.5 1 Eppendrof | 13896
pl (Marketed
By Ideal
S.D.Fine) Chemicals
0.5-10 1 Eppendrof | 13896
pl (Marketed
By Ideal
S.D.Fine) Chemicals
2-20 1 Eppendrof | 13896
ul (Marketed
By Ideal
S.D.Fine) Chemicals
10-100 1 Eppendrof | 13896
pl (Marketed
By Ideal
S.D.Fine) Chemicals
50-200 1 Eppendrof | 13896
pl (Marketed
By Ideal
S.D.Fine) Chemicals
100- 1 Eppendrof | 13896
1000 pl (Marketed
By Ideal
S.D.Fine) Chemicals
500-2,500 1 Eppendrof | 13896
pl (Marketed
By Ideal
Chemicals

S.D.Fine)




90. | 275 Micropipette fixed Eppendrof | 10734
volume — (Marketed
By Ideal
S.D.Fine) Chemicals
1 ul Eppendrof | 10734
(Marketed
By Ideal
S.D.Fine) Chemicals
2 ul Eppendrof | 10734
(Marketed
By Ideal
S.D.Fine) Chemicals
5 ul Eppendrof | 10734
(Marketed
By Ideal
S.D.Fine) Chemicals
10 Eppendrof | 10734
(Marketed
By Ideal
S.D.Fine) Chemicals
25 ul Eppendrof | 10734
(Marketed
By Ideal
S.D.Fine) Chemicals
50 ul Eppendrof | 10734
(Marketed
By Ideal
S.D.Fine) Chemicals
100 pl Eppendrof | 10734
(Marketed
By Ideal
S.D.Fine) Chemicals
91. | 276 Auto pipette Stand NQ
92. 277 Single piece wash 6/pk 6pc Tarson 372
Bottle with Nozzle Kasliwal
500ml graduated Brothers | Single Bid
93. | 278 |Glass funnel ( large and large small Borosil [122 93| Kasliwal
small) Brothers | Single Bid
94. | 279 | Plastic funnel ( large 150 mm | 24 pcs. Axiva | 1040.00 | Scientific
and small) 75mm | 36pcs. | Axiva | 257.00 Traders | Single Bid
95. 280 | Conical flasks (100ml) Borosil 57.5 Kasliwal
Glass Brothers | Single Bid
96. | 281 | Conical flasks (250ml) Borosil 92 Kasliwal
Glass Brothers | Single Bid
97. | 282 | Conical flasks (500ml) Borosil 122 Kasliwal
Glass Brothers | Single Bid
98. | 283 [Conical flasks (1000ml) Borosil 212 Kasliwal
Glass Brothers | Single Bid
99. | 284 [ Petri dishes single 460/pk 450 Tarson 2935 Kasliwal
sterile (90x15 mm) Brothers
100. | 285 | Tissue culture Petri 20/pk 500 Tarson 5175
Dish—9.2 cu cm 14/pk
(40x10ml) 22.1 cu Kasliwal
cm(60x15 ml) Brothers
101. | 286 Measuring spatula,
Round end/spoon NQ
Flat end/spoon NQ
V-scoop/spoon NQ
Microspatula rounded
end/scoop NQ
102. | 287 | Petri seal tape clear 0.5 x108 /roll 1 Tarson 3660 Kasliwal

Brothers




103. | 288 Petri stickers 32 square
grid,36/box NQ
104. | 289 | Reagent storage bottle 1/pk 12 nos | HIMEDIA | 2212
(150ml) disposable
polystyrene Ideal
Chemicals | Single Bid
105. | 290 | Reagent storage bottle 1/pk 12 nos | HIMEDIA | 2497
(250 ml) disposable
polystyrene Ideal
Chemicals | Single Bid
106. | 291 | Reagent storage bottle 1/pk 12 nos | HIMEDIA | 2785
(500 ml) disposable
polystyrene Ideal
Chemicals | Single Bid
107. | 292 | Reagent storage bottle 1/pk 12 nos | HIMEDIA | 5711
(1000ml) disposable
polystyrene Ideal
Chemicals | Single Bid
108. | 293 | Reagent storage bottle 1/pk 1/pk 208 Kasliwal
50 ml__ Glass Brothers | Single Bid
109. [ 294 [ Reagent storage bottle 1/pk 1/pk 225 Kasliwal
100 ml_Glass Brothers | Single Bid
110. | 295 | Reagent storage bottle 1/pk 1/pk 233 Kasliwal
250 ml_ Glass Brothers | Single Bid
111. | 296 | Reagent storage bottle 1/pk 1/pk 250 Kasliwal
500 ml_Glass Brothers | Single Bid
112. | 297 [ Reagent storage bottle 1/pk 1/pk 368 Kasliwal
1000 ml_Glass Brothers | Single Bid
113. | 298 Litmus paper MOLYCH | 115 Ideal
EM Chemicals
114. | 299 | Glass tray - 1500ml 5/pk 5 pc Borosil 1890 Kasliwal
(320x180x51) Brothers Single Bid
- 2400ml (350x200x58) 5/pk 5 pc 2625 Kasliwal
Brothers | Single Bid
115. | 300 Metal tray (large) 255 Kasliwal
Brothers | Single Bid
116. | 301 Metal tray (small) 199 Kasliwal
Brothers | Single Bid
117. | 302 [ Micro syringe 10 ul 1/pk Hamilton | 11500 Kasliwal
with adjustible stop Brothers
118. | 303 Tissue Paper rolls PANAMA 19 Ideal
Chemicals
119. | 304 Brown Paper
NQ
120. | 305 | Filter Paper (ordinary) Ream of 1500 Kasliwal
500 Brothers
121. | 306 [Autoclavable Bottle top| 0.2-1ml 1 Borosil 8040
Dispenser -
0.4-2ml 1 Borosil 8040
2-10 ml 1 Borosil 8040
5-25 ml 1 Borosil 12195 Kasliwal
10-50ml 1 Borosil 12200 Brothers
122. | 307 Glass Measuring (10 ml) 1 Borosil 198 Kasliwal
Cylinder Brothers | Single Bid
123. | 308 Glass Measuring (25ml) 1 Borosil 234 Kasliwal
Cylinder Brothers | Single Bid
124. | 309 Glass Measuring (50ml) 1 Borosil 255 Kasliwal
Cylinder Brothers | Single Bid
125. | 310 Glass Measuring ( 100ml) 1 Borosil 291 Kasliwal
Cylinder Brothers | Single Bid
126. | 311 Glass Measuring (250ml) 1 Borosil 530 Kasliwal
Cylinder Brothers | Single Bid




127. | 312 Glass Measuring (500ml) 1 Borosil 730 Kasliwal
Cylinder Brothers | Single Bid
128. | 313 Glass Measuring 1 Borosil 1108
Cy”nder Kasliwal
(1000ml) Brothers | Single Bid
129. | 314 Deleted due to repeatation of items
130. | 315 Timer 1 pc. Pacer 435 Scientific
Traders
131. | 316 4% Sodium 5 lit Molychem 339
Hypochlorite Solution Ideal
Chemicals
132. | 317 | Filter paper Whatman 100/pk 125mm, Whatman 1875
185mm, 4220 Kasliwal
240mm 6940 Brothers | Single Bid
Grade 602 h circles Kasliwal
125mm,185mm,240mm Brothers | Single Bid
133. | 318 [Sample storage box 2-3| (100 holes) Tarson 358 Kasliwal
ml plastic vials Brothers | Single Bid
134. | 319 Sealing tapes for (clear/white/ Tarson 3660
labwares yellow)(0.5' Kasliwal
108cm) Brothers
135. | 320 Parafilm rolls (10 cm x125 Tarson 1585 Kasliwal
cm)3" dia Brothers
136. | 321 Ependorf tubes) (0.5ml,1.5 10.5m1.5m| 500 Eppendof | 3681.00
ml,2ml 2.0m 1000 | (Marketed | 3719.00
1000 By 5067.00 |deal
S.S.Fine) Chemicals
137. | 322 | Eppendorf PCR clean | 0.5ml,1.5ml |0.5m 1.5m| 500 Eppendof | 3912.00
2ml 2.0m 1000 | (Marketed | 3912.00
1000 By 5321.00 Ideal
S.S.Fine) Chemicals
138. | 323 | Biopor safe lock micro [ o.5ml,2ml | 0.5m 2ml 50n Eppendof | 2456.00
test tube 100 n | (Marketed | 3357.00
By Ideal
S.S.Fine) Chemicals
139. | 324 | Peel off self adhesive [(pkt of 1000)
labels white 3/4"x1/2"
140. | 325 Eppendorf lid bac 100x2 ml
Safe lock
tubes
100
membrane
lids
141. | 326 Aluminium foil L roll 85 Kasliwal
Brothers
142. | 327 | Cryogenic Containers | 30 L,50L | 301 501 | 1 unit Axiva 55243 Scientific
1 unit Axiva 64939 Traders Single Bid
143. | 328 Accessories for
Cryogenic Containers:
-Liquid measuring scale 1 unit axiva 802 Scientific
Traders | Single Bid
-Liquid withdrawl 1 unit axiva 9055 Scientific
device Traders | Single Bid
144. | 329 [ Volex Nitrile gloves | 50 pair pack 100 pcs. | Axiva 804 Scientific
Traders
145. | 330 Clean room wipes  [11.3x 20 cms 1 box Axiva 356 Scientific
Traders
146. | 331 | Tissue culture flasks- | 60ml,10/pk
270ml,5/pk




690ml, 3/pk

1360ml 3/pk
147. | 332 Angled lifter Cell 1/pk
Scrapers
148. | 333 Cryo gloves 1 pair Axiva 11213 Scientific
Traders
149. | 334 | Toughtags (blue and [0.94x0.5"/10 1000 ABDOS 2850
green) 00 Nos.
150. | 335 Storage vials with 2ml 500/pk | 2.0 ml | 500/pkt Axiva 853.00 | Scientific 2ml
screw external threads- | 5ml 100/pk | 5.0 ml 100 pc 295.00 | kasliwal 5 ml
151. | 336 | Screw caps cryo vials | 1.5ml,2 ml 500 pcs. | Genaxy 6183
pre-sterelized self |1000/pk each Scientific
standing Traders
152. | 337 | Cryo boxes with cover 4/pk 08 nos. | ABDOS 1026 Surana
Enterprises
153. | 338 | Petridish ETO sterile 460/pk 450 pc | Tarson 2610 Kasliwal
Brothers
154. | 339 [ Petridish GAMMA 460/pk 450 pc | Tarson 2935 Kasliwal
sterile Brothers
155. | 340 | Sample container ETO 500/pk 500/pkt. Axiva 284
sterile individually
packed disposable 60 Scientific
mi Traders
156. | 341 [ Petridish Autoclavable [ 100mmx 15 20 pcs. | Axiva 530 scientfic
mm  20/pk Traders
157. | 342 [ Swabs in stick sterile | 150 mm 10x100/p|  Axiva 2420 scientfic
individually packed 100/pk kt. Traders
158. | 343 Serological pipettes |1ml,2ml,5ml, 1ml 1x100 | HIMEDIA | 968.00
- 10ml,25ml 2ml 1244.00
1/pk 5ml 1637.00
10ml 1769.00 |deal
25 ml 3633.00 | Chemicals
159. | 344 |Eppendorf filter pipette single- single- 480 pc | Eppendorf | 4565
tips ( Box of 100 tips) | channel 0.5 | channel
filter tips with pl-10 wl - | 0.5 pi-10 Kasliwal
maximum biological ul Brothers [ Single Bid
purity, sterile, pyrogen- | 5 HI-100 pl [5 pl-100 pl| 480 pc | Eppendorf [ 4200 Kasliwal
free, RNase-free, DNA- Brothers | Single Bid
free and ATP-free | 20 ul-300 pl | 20 pl-300 | 480 pc | Eppendorf | 4200 Kasliwal
ul Brothers | Single Bid
50 pl-1,000 | 50 pl- | 480 pc | Eppendorf | 4200 Kasliwal
ul 1,000 pl Brothers | Single Bid
100 pl-5,000 NQ
ul
Multi- Multi- Eppendorf -
channel channel
0.5 ul-10 pl | 0.5 ul-10 | 480 pc | Eppendorf | 4565 Kasliwal
ul Brothers | Single Bid
5 ul-100 pl [5 pI-100 pl| 480 pc | Eppendorf | 4200 Kasliwal
Brothers | Single Bid
20 pI-300 pl | 20 pI-300 | 480 pc | Eppendorf | 4200 Kasliwal
ul Brothers | Single Bid
50 ul-1,200 | 50 pl- | 480 pc | Eppendorf | 4200 Kasliwal
1,200 Brothers | Single Bid
160. | 345 [ PCRtubes 0.2ml, 1000 /pk 0.2ml, [ 1000 pc | Tarson 14220 Kasliwal
0.5ml, 500/pk 0.5ml 500 pc 4930 Brothers | Single Bid
161. | 346 PCR Rack 10/pk 6pc 10 Tarson 1420 Kasliwal
pc Eppendorf | 15170 Brothers | Single Bid
162. | 347 |PCR Plate 96 wells,384| 50/pk each 10 nos. |[ABDOS -| 1945.00
wells 10nos. | ---- | 3290.00 Surana

ABDOS

Enterprises




163. | 348 PCR film and foil PCR film Eppendorf | 147.50 Ideal
PCR Foil Eppendorf | 147.50 | Chemicals |Single Bid
164. | 349 FROSTED 50 slides/pk 50 per | Blue Star 51.44
MICROSLIDES 1.00 pack |deal
mm Chemicals
165. | 350 PLAIN PRINTED 50 nos | Blue Star 42 Ideal
SLIDES 75x25 MM Chemicals
166. | 351 COVER SLIPS 20x10 BlueStar | 1046.00
SQUARE & gm BlueStar | 1079.00
RECTANGULAR 20x10 scientfic
am Traders
167. | 352 | Sonar microglasses no. | 10 gms/pk 20x10 Sonar 1802.00
0 ( square and gm Sonar 1803.00
rectangle) 20x10 scientfic
gm Traders | Single Bid
168. | 353 |Syringe filters pore size{ 50/pack 50/pkt. [ Axiva(SFC| 3185.00
0.45u (Axygen)431218 50/pkt. A25X) 3848.00
Axiva(SFC scientfic
A33X) Traders
169. | 354 |[Syringe filters pore size{ 50/pack 50/pkt. | Axiva(SFC| 3185.00
0.22(Axygen)431220 50/pkt. | A25R) | 3848.00
Axiva(SFC scientfic
A33R) Traders Single Bid
170. | 355 | Membrane filters -CN 100/pk 100/pkt. Axiva 752.00
0.2 1,045 p 100/pkt. | (160013R) | 752.00
100/pkt. Axiva 840.00
100/pkt. | (160013X) | 840.00
100/pkt. Axiva 1327.00
100/pkt. | (160025R) | 1327.00
Axiva
(160025X)
Axiva
(1%3‘\1/?) scientfic
(1800A7RN Traders
171. | 356 | Syringe filter holder 13mm 25| 1pc. Axiva 1770.00
—SS 13 mm,25 mm mm 1pc. | (FHSS13) | 2123.00
Axiva scientfic
(EHSS 25) Traders
172. | 357 Filter funnel with white 1 pc. Axiva 1770.00
receiving flask amber 1 pc. (KP14U) | 2522.00
—PSF/PC 47 mm Axiva scientfic
300ml (KP14S) Traders
173. | 358 | Membrane filtration 1000 ml ASGI 1560.00
assembly Glass - 500 ml 2405.00 Ideal
1000ml, 500ml Chemicals
174. | 359 Coupline jar 12/pk 12/pkt. |  Axiva 233 scientfic
Traders
175. | 360 Test tube baskets - 6/pk each |140x120x1 Tarson 645.00
140x120x110 mm 10 mm 990.00
160x160x160 mm 160x160x1 Kasliwal
60 mm Brothers | Single Bid
176. | 361 |Orange centrifuge tubes|  20/bag 500 nos. | ABDOS 4670
50ml with skirt self Surana
standing Enterprises | Single Bid
177. | 362 | Micropipette variable 1 no. Fine care 2060
volume 0.1-2 pl, Surana
increment 0.01 Enterprises
178. | 363 [ Neubaeur counting 1 1400 Kasliwal
chamber Brothers | Single Bid
179. | 364 Rubber bands pkt Local 150 Ideal
Chemicals | Single Bid
180. | 365 Sterile head Caps 100 Amkey 250 Ideal
Chemicals | Single Bid




181. | 366 Forceps Pionear 150 Ideal
Chemicals | Single Bid
182. | 367 | Autoclavable microtip 1 no. Fine care 57
box 0.2-1 pl,1-10 pl,10-
100 p1,200-1000 pl Surana
Enterprises
183. | 368 Sterile disposable 10 ml 100x1 | HIMEDIA [ 986 Ideal
pipettes Chemicals
5 ml HIMEDIA | 1244 Ideal
Chemicals
2ml HIMEDIA | 1637 Ideal
Chemicals
iml HIMEDIA [ 1769 Ideal
Chemicals
184. | 369 Confocal grade
microscopic slides NQ
185. | 370 Cell culture flasks-
Canted/angled
neck,Phenolic cap style
Growtharea: 25 20/pk 1 Tarson 40 Kasliwal
cm? Brothers
75 5/pk 1 Tarson 80.3 Kasliwal
cm? Brothers
175 5/pk 1 Tarson 144.5 Kasliwal
cm’ Brothers
186. | 371 Cell culture treated 20/pk 60 mm (21 1 Tarson 12.50
dishes cm2) Tarson 19.60
60 mm(21 cm?) 100 mm Kasliwal
100 mm( 55 cm2) (55 cm2) Brothers
187. | 372 Cell culture plates 6 5/pk Tarson 77 )
well plates Sterile Kasliwal
Standard clear plate Brothers
188. | 373 Disposable gowns 1 New Life 105 Ideal
Chemicals | Single Bid
189. | 374 Gauze Kartik 220 Ideal
Chemicals | Single Bid
190. | 375 | Dulbecco's Modified oL Sigma 5025 )
Eagles (Medium Kasliwal
(DMEM) D777) Brothers | Single Bid
191. | 376 Sample Storage Tarson 6.55 Kasliwal
plasti/glass container Brothers | Single Bid
192. | 377 Tongue Depressor | 100 pc/ Pack
NQ
193. | 378 | Mask (Disposable) 100/ pkt 100 nos | Amkey 230 Ideal
Chemicals
194. | 379 Hand Gloves ( 100/ pkt 100 SURGICA 200 _
Unsterile) RE Syma medical
dental surgical
195. | 380 Hand Gloves 100 pair/ pkt 100 nos | Kaltex 220 Ideal
(Sterlized) Chemicals | Single Bid
196. | 381 | Tissue Papers rolls 100 gm 1roll | Panama 19 Ideal
Chemicals | Single Bid
197. | 382 | Napkins (Towel) Hand | Cotton, soft,
white color
NQ
198. | 383 Table Covers Green, cotton
NQ
199. | 384 Towel (Seat) Large | Cotton, soft,
Turkish white color
NQ
200. | 385 Cotton (Pad) Rolls of roll 500 | mamta/ 104
500gm gm surbhi Pharmadeal




201. | 386 Gauge Soft, white, than bharat- 120
surgical Pharmadeal
202. | 387 Syringe 2ml 100pc [ HMD | 183.87
Syma medical
dental surgical
203. | 388 Syringe 5ml 100 HMD 242.57
Syma medical
dental surgical
204. | 389 Syringe 10 ml 50 HMD 162.77
Syma medical
dental surgical
205. [ 390 | Test Tupe 100 pc/Pkt. | KT/ Plastic/ 100 pc Tarson 373
high quality, )
100 pc/Pkt. Kasliwal
Brothers | Single Bid
206. | 391 Vaccutaines 3ml, EDTA 1 bio invitro 1.8
Pharmadeal
207. | 392 Vaccutaines 3ml, PLAIN 1 bio invitro 1.7
Pharmadeal
208. | 393 Dust bin Small size
NQ
209. | 394 Bio-waste dust bin | Medium size
NQ
210. | 395 | Waste disposal bags | Plastic Bag 200 nos. | ABDOS 15960
100/ pkt Single Bid
211. | 396 Disposable gowns 1 New Life 105 Ideal
Chemicals | Single Bid
212. | 397 Gauze Kartik 220 Ideal
Chemicals | Single Bid
213. | 398 | Dulbecco's Modified 10L Sigma 5025
Eagles (Medium ) )
(DMEM) D777) Single Bid
214. | 399 Sample Storage
plasti/glass container NQ
Small equipment and instrument
S.No| Ref. Specificatio
No. Name of ftems nif any L1 Remark
Make Price [Firm Remark
1 1 Lab Centrifuge
2 2 B.P. Apparatus Diamond 1800[Pharmadeal  [Single Bid
3 3 Stethoscope Diamond 375|Pharmadeal  [Single Bid
4 Clinical
4 Thermometer Hicks 27 Pharmadeal | Single Bid
5 5 Fundoscope No Bid
6 6 Otoscope No Bid
7 7 Torche No Bid
Knee- hammer .
8 8 No Bid
9 Syringe needle . SR .
9 et sr Labline 1514 Traders | Single Bid
10 Microscope Scientific
10 Labomed | 21352 Traders
C0|0l’lmetel‘ SCIETIUTIC
| 1 Labtronics| 7045 Traders  [Single Bid
Haemoglo-binometer . T .
12 | 12 g Labtronics| 6422 Traders | Single Bid
Manual Cell Counter .
13 | 13 No Bid
3 Part Haemolo PV SRR .
ar raemorogy with | 354165 | Traders |Single Bid




T Horiba
14 with dot
matrix Scientific
14 printer | 312795 Traders | Single Bid
Electrophoresis
15 Apparatus Not found
15 suitable
Medicines
S.No| Ref. Specificatio
. | No. Name of Items nif any L1 Remark
1l 1 Paracetamol 650 mg No bid
2 Paracetamol + 325+ 37 )
2 Tramadol No bid
3 Paracetamol + 325+ 400 )
3 Ibuprofen No bid
4 Norfloxacin + 400 +500 )

4 Tinidazole No bid

5 5 Tab. Ondensetron 8 mg. No bid

6| 6 Hydroxyurea Syrup (100ml) No bid

71 7 Levoflox (500 mg) No bid

0.5 ml vial
8 Pneuchoccal .
8 Polysaccharide Vaccine No bid
9 Haemo. Influenza 1B | 0.5 ml vial _

9 conjugate vaccine No bid
10{ 10 | Tab. Penicillin G 200 No bid
11| 11 | Tab. Penicillin G 400 No bid
12| 12 | Tab. Penicillin G 800 No bid




